

**ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION  
ARDOT TABULATION**

Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

Cab & Chassis \_\_\_\_\_

CONTRACT NO.: H-18-276H

DATE OPENED: 5/22/2018

FOB: Barling, Little Rock, & Camden, AR

PAGE: 1 of 7

VENDOR:		Timberline 1967 E Grand Ave. Hot Springs, AR 71901 Paul Williams 501-623-1665 <a href="mailto:pwilliams@cablelynx.com">pwilliams@cablelynx.com</a>			HYDRAULIC HOIST - MAILHOT POWER TAKE-OFF - SAUR DANFOSS  <p align="center"><b>PRIMARY</b></p>			
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DUMP BODY	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1.	2	110,592.54	221,185.08	INTERNATIONAL	HV507	VIKING	12/15/2018	12/31/2018
2.	5	106,822.94	534,114.70	INTERNATIONAL	HV507	VIKING	12/15/2018	12/31/2018
3.	3	110,449.00	331,347.00	INTERNATIONAL	HV507 SFA	EJECTO E5B	12/15/2018	12/30/2018
TOTAL:			1,086,646.78					
TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD:								

CARD: 00-25, 01-33, 01-40

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE: \_\_\_\_\_

ITEM(S): \_\_\_\_\_

AWARDED TO: \_\_\_\_\_

**ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION  
ARDOT TABULATION**

Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

Cab & Chassis  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_

CONTRACT NO.: H-18-276H

DATE OPENED: 5/22/2018

FOB: Barling, Little Rock, & Camden, AR

PAGE: 2 of 7

VENDOR:		Summit Truck Group 11401 Diamond Drive North Little Rock, AR 72117 Robbin Haley 501-945-8400 robbin .haley@summittruckgroup.com			HYDRAULIC HOIST - MAILHOT C590-4.5-3DA POWER TAKE-OFF - SAUR DAUFAS JRL75CC  <b>OPTION 1</b>			
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DUMP BODY	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1.	2	109,780.00	219,560.00	INTERNATIONAL	HV607	VIKING HT103030	360 Days ARO	10/31/2018
2.	5	106,165.00	530,825.00	INTERNATIONAL	HV607	VIKING HT103030	360 Days ARO	10/31/2018
3.	3	113,955.00	341,865.00	INTERNATIONAL	HV607	STEPHENS EJECTO E5B	320 Days ARO	10/31/2018
TOTAL:			1,092,250.00					
TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD:			750,385.00					

CARD: 00-25, 01-33, 01-40

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: Purchasing Committee

DATE: 6/18/2018

ITEM(S): Item 1 & Item 2

AWARDED TO: Summit Truck Group (7/6/2018)

**ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION  
ARDOT TABULATION**

Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

Cab & Chassis \_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_

CONTRACT NO.: H-18-276H

DATE OPENED: 5/22/2018

FOB: Barling, Little Rock, & Camden, AR

PAGE: 3 of 7

VENDOR:		Doggett Freightliner of Arkansas 11700 Valentine Road North Little Rock, AR 72117 Robert Mooney 501-955-3200 <a href="mailto:robert.mooney@doggett.com">robert.mooney@doggett.com</a>			HYDRAULIC HOIST- MAILHOT C590-4.5-3DA POWER TAKE OFF - SAUR DANFOSS JRL75CC			
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DUMP BODY	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1.	2	114,719.00	229,438.00	FREIGHTLINER	108SD	VIKING HT103030	300 Days ARO	2/27/2019
2.	5	112,156.00	560,780.00	FREIGHTLINER	108SD	VIKING HT103030	300 Days ARO	2/27/2019
3.	3	117,801.00	353,403.00	FREIGHTLINER	108SD	STEPHENS EJECTO-E5B	300 Days ARO	2/27/2019
TOTAL:			1,143,621.00					
TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD:								

CARD: 00-25, 01-33, 01-40

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE: \_\_\_\_\_

ITEM(S): \_\_\_\_\_

AWARDED TO: \_\_\_\_\_

**ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION  
ARDOT TABULATION**

Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

Cab & Chassis \_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_

CONTRACT NO.: H-18-276H

DATE OPENED: 5/22/2018

FOB: Barling, Little Rock, & Camden, AR

PAGE: 4 of 7

VENDOR: Summit Truck Group 11401 Diamond Drive North Little Rock, AR 72117 Robbin Haley 501-945-8400 robbin .haley@summittruckgroup.com				HYDRAULIC HOIST - MAILHOT C590-4.5-3DA  <b>OPTION 3</b>				
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DUMP BODY	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1.	2	116,624.00	233,248.00	INTERNATIONAL	HV607	HILBILT XPC	360 Days ARO	10/31/2018
2.	5	113,009.00	565,045.00	INTERNATIONAL	HV607	HILBILT XPC	360 Days ARO	10/31/2018
3.	3	NO BID						
TOTAL:			798,293.00					
TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD:								

CARD: 00-25, 01-33, 01-40

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE: \_\_\_\_\_

ITEM(S): \_\_\_\_\_

AWARDED TO: \_\_\_\_\_

**ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION  
ARDOT TABULATION**

Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

Cab & Chassis \_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_

CONTRACT NO.: H-18-276H

DATE OPENED: 5/22/2018

FOB: Barling, Little Rock, & Camden, AR

PAGE: 5 of 7

VENDOR:		Timberline 1967 E Grand Ave. Hot Springs, AR 71901 Paul Williams 501-623-1665 <a href="mailto:pwilliams@cablelynx.com">pwilliams@cablelynx.com</a>			HYDRAULIC HOIST - MAILHOT			
		ALTERNATE						
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DUMP BODY	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1.	2	117,436.54	234,873.08	INTERNATIONAL	HV507	HILBILT XPC	12/15/2018	12/31/2018
2.	5	113,666.94	568,334.70	INTERNATIONAL	HV507	HILBILT XPC	12/15/2018	12/31/2018
3.	3	NO BID						
TOTAL:			803,207.78					
TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD:								

CARD: 00-25, 01-33, 01-40

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE: \_\_\_\_\_

ITEM(S): \_\_\_\_\_

AWARDED TO: \_\_\_\_\_

**ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION**  
**ARDOT TABULATION**

Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

Cab & Chassis

---



---

CONTRACT NO.: H-18-276H

DATE OPENED: 5/22/2018

FOB: Barling, Little Rock, & Camden, AR

PAGE: 6 of 7

VENDOR:		Carco International Inc. 2721 Midland Blvd Fort Smith, AR 72904 Patrick Jacobs 479-719-5385 <a href="mailto:pjacobs@carcointl.com">pjacobs@carcointl.com</a>			HYDRAULIC HOIST - MAILHOT C590-4.5-3DA POWER TAKE-OFF - SAUR DANFOSS			
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DUMP BODY	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1.	2	110,513.85	221,027.70	INTERNATIONAL	HV507	VIKING HT103030	6/1/2019	12/31/2018
2.	5	NO BID						
3.	3	NO BID						
TOTAL:			221,027.70					
TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD:								

CARD: 00-25, 01-33, 01-40

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE: \_\_\_\_\_

ITEM(S): \_\_\_\_\_

AWARDED TO: \_\_\_\_\_

**ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION**  
**ARDOT TABULATION**

Form P-359 Rev. 3-10-2017

DESCRIPTION:

Cab & Chassis  
\_\_\_\_\_  
\_\_\_\_\_

CONTRACT NO.: H-18-276H

DATE OPENED: 5/22/2018

FOB: Barling, Little Rock, & Camden, AR

PAGE: 7 of 7

VENDOR:	Summit Truck Group 11401 Diamond Drive North Little Rock, AR 72117 Robbin Haley 501-945-8400 robbin .haley@summittruckgroup.com				HYDRAULIC HOIST - MAILHOT C590-4.5-3DA POWER TAKE-OFF - SAUR DANFOSS JRL75CC  <b>OPTION 2</b>			
ITEM NO.	QTY.	PRICE	EXTENSION	MAKE	MODEL	DUMP BODY	DELIVERY	ADDITIONAL UNIT PURCHASES
1.	2	NO BID						
2.	5	NO BID						
3.	3	108,075.00	324,225.00	INTERNATIONAL	HV607	STEPHENS E5B	320 Days ARO	10/31/2018
TOTAL:			324,225.00					
TOTALRECOMMENDED AWARD:			324,225.00					

CARD: 00-25, 01-33, 01-40

TENTATIVE AWARD BY: Purchasing Committee  
ITEM(S): Item 3  
AWARDED TO: Summit Truck Group (7/06/2018)

DATE: 6/18/2018